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workers in spaces not typically associ-
ated with worker power. In order to un-
derstand retail worker resistance, Kenny 
shows us how significant it is to under-
stand the ways in which race, gender, 
and class constitute abasebenzi, a colle-
tive political subject that mobilizes retail 
workers and fuels worker resistance.

Kaitlyn Matulewicz
University of British Columbia

Valeria Vegh Weis, Marxism and 
Criminology: A History of Criminal 
Selectivity (Leiden: Brill 2017)

Marxism and Criminology is the type 
of book no historian would ever write, 
but that all historians of policing and the 
state should read. It is full of big ideas and 
meta-analyses that our monographs of-
ten lack, and it has many crucial insights 
about the ways that the construction of 
“crime” have changed during the long 
history of capitalism. Vegh Weis does not 
use sources in the way that a historian 
would, and that is both the weakness and 
the strength of the book, since it allows 
her to undertake a broader, more creative, 
and in some ways more insightful inves-
tigation as a result, but one that uses sec-
ondary literature rather uncritically.

Vegh Weis traces the entire history 
of “crime” under capitalism through the 
lens of what she calls “criminal selectiv-
ity.” By this she means that in each phase 
of capitalist development, some types 
of socially destructive activities were 
“under-criminalized,” while other were 
“over-criminalized.” She illustrates how 
the laws defining “crime” changed over 
time to fit the needs of the ruling class, 
and explores how certain types of laws 
were over- and others under-enforced. 
She argues persuasively that criminal 
selectivity has been shaped by the class 
dynamics of capitalism, and the needs of 
capital accumulation at various stages, 

an insight that she reached by applying a 
Marxist approach.

This framework allows Vegh Weis to 
trace the evolution of criminal selectiv-
ity through three large-scale phases of 
capitalist development. During the first 
phase of primitive accumulation, the 
brutal conquest of the colonies, slavery, 
and the enclosure of the commons were 
all “under-criminalized.” Resistance to 
colonial brutality, and petty crimes of 
survival by those who had been stripped 
of access to the means of subsistence 
were over-criminalized. During the 
second phase, which Vegh Weis terms 
“disciplining criminal selectivity,” po-
licing and punishment evolved. Crimes 
of brutal exploitation, further coloniza-
tion, organized crime, and corruption 
were variously “under-criminalized,” 
while petty crimes and resistance by the 
working class were “over-criminalized.” 
At the end of this period, Vegh Weis ar-
gues that the development of the welfare 
state in the United States and Western 
Europe was a new form of social control 
that helped to discipline and divide the 
working class, supplemented by contin-
ued over-criminalization of the activities 
of those she terms “paupers.” Crimes car-
ried out by the bourgeois state – imperi-
alist wars in particular – continued to be 
under-criminalized.

The last stage, which is continuing 
to this day, Vegh Weis terms “bulimic 
criminal selectivity.” In this phase, as 
capitalism has entered another era of 
crisis, it culturally swallows its paupers, 
while expelling them economically. In 
other words, poor people especially in the 
United States are included in bourgeois 
culture, while being denied the means 
to achieve the consumerism so central 
to it. Crime control, especially of those 
Vegh Weiss terms “social dynamite,” has 
become crucial to maintaining the bour-
geois order, even as much more socially 
destructive crimes like those committed 
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in the name of the War on Terror or the 
financial crimes that have become cen-
tral to the functioning of capitalism are 
under-criminalized.

For each stage, Vegh Weiss differenti-
ates between the manifest functions of a 
given system of criminalization and its 
latent functions. The manifest functions 
in the early stage revolve around religion 
and then an Enlightenment version of 
“equality before the law” that she draws 
on Marx to critique, before shifting to 
medical (largely racist) and then crimino-
logical theories to justify the functions of 
the “criminal justice” system. She shows 
how these manifest functions cannot ad-
equately explain the actual criminal se-
lectivity carried out by the state – which 
requires a deeper, Marxist analysis of the 
latent functions of criminal selectivity in 
a given stage. The latent function of the 
under-criminalization of the enclosure 
movement and its violence, for instance, 
was its necessity to the rising bourgeoisie, 
whatever legal justifications might have 
been manifest. Despite the moral panics 
that manifestly justified the war on crime 
in the late-20th century United States, its 
latent functions included controlling the 
“social dynamite” and dividing the work-
ing class.

Marxism and Criminology is quite 
convincing in its overall argument that a 
long-range, Marxist approach to under-
standing how “crime” and “crime con-
trol” have evolved with capitalism has a 
great deal of explanatory power. There 
are some places, however, where I wish 
Vegh Weiss had sharpened her Marxist 
analysis. The book’s clear phases of capi-
talist development, laid out in charts in 
the introduction and conclusion, inhibit 
Vegh Weiss from fully investigating how 
they interpenetrated each other, and 
how the shift from one to the next was 
driven by both class dynamics and the 
economic evolution of capitalism. In 
other words, her book could use a more 

dialectical approach. Also, she largely 
draws from Marx’s economic works (es-
pecially Capital) and doesn’t engage with 
the historical texts where Marx really de-
velops the concept of the bourgeois state 
and explores its dynamics. For instance, 
the “Socio-disciplining selectivity” of the 
early- to mid-20th century welfare state 
that Vegh Weis describes had origins in 
the class conflict of the early English la-
bor movement and in the French revolu-
tion of 1848, analyzed at length in “Class 
Struggle in France” and “The Eighteenth 
Brumaire,” in addition to Capital.

Vegh Weis also takes analyses and ex-
amples from historians and social scien-
tists in a selective and uncritical way, and 
this leads her to state as fact some ideas 
that are quite controversial, and at other 
places to dramatically overstate some of 
her points. For instance, in her discussion 
of the ways that “paupers” are “super-
culturalized” in consumerism during the 
phase of “bulimic criminal selectivity,” 
Vegh Weis states that “people in some 
slums in the United States do not even 
know how to sign or write their names, 
but they know the names of very exclusive 
brands as Prada or Gucci because they 
are bombarded with promotion or adver-
tising all day long…. These impoverished 
sectors … watch television 11 hours a day. 
They share the obsession of a violent cul-
ture. They supported the U.S. incursions 
of the Gulf War. They worship success, 
money, wealth and status and even the 
racism of society.” (196) Taken by itself, 
this quote is the kind of vast overgeneral-
ization that leads historians to reject the 
insights of many social scientists. I would 
need a lot more evidence to be convinced 
there are very many people who fit this 
description. In fact, throughout the book, 
Vegh Weis herself has a much more nu-
anced approach to “paupers.” This over-
statement comes from her uncritical and 
overstated use of Jock Young’s The Vertigo 
of Late Modernity (Thousand Oaks: Sage 
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Publications, 2007). This one stands out, 
but there are similarly overstated pas-
sages and uncritical uses of secondary 
literature throughout the book that are 
annoying to a historian.

However, despite these critiques, 
Vegh Weis’ book is essential reading. Its 
breadth of analysis allows Marxism and 

Criminology to take on the types of big 
questions that historical monographs of-
ten miss, and its openly Marxist perspec-
tive is refreshing in an era when many 
historians have retreated from any type 
of theoretical analysis. 

Sam Mitrani
College of DuPage


